



Chromebook Purchase

Presentation for SUSD Governing Board

Debi Spaulding, Chief Systems Officer

04/17/18



Current State of Site Computers

- Age is typically 6-8 years
- Inconsistent ratio of computers per student
- Variety of desktops, laptops and Chromebooks
- Quantity: 18,216



Goals

- Equitable distribution of devices for sites
- Starting next fiscal year, replace existing devices over 5 years



Request for Quotes

Part Number	Quantity	CDW-G	MILESTONE	NEED THESE	OFFICE DEPOT	SAFARI MICROS	WWT
TGLOCK	77	2,016.63	1,898.82	1973.51	1,831.06	1,259.72	NO BID
AC-PRO-II	13	16,770.00	17,668.82	19376.5	18,483.53	16,298.88	NO BID
AC-SLIM	64	80,000.00	80,860.16	88633.6	80,975.36	72,189.44	NO BID
Assembly	77	10,780.00	4,997.30	7623.6	NO BID	INCLUDED IN WHITE GLOVE	NO BID
Lenovo 300e-81H00000US	2668	675,004.00	NO BID	708033.84	691,919.12	722,814.56	NO BID
HP Chromebook x360 - 11 G1 EE 2DQ88UT	2668	NO BID	717,692.00	891352.12	NO BID	818,489.04	NO BID
White Glove Service	2668	18,676.00	102,718.00	40020	20,677.00	65,579.44	NO BID
CROSSWDISEDU	2668	66,700.00	INCLUDED IN WHITE GLOVE	66700	62,698.00	64,432.20	NO BID
BARCODE	2668	13,340.00	INCLUDED IN WHITE GLOVE	1372.5	INCLUDED	INCLUDED IN WHITE GLOVE	NO BID
SUB-TOTAL		883,286.63	925,835.10		876,584.07	LENOVO 942,574.24 HP 1,038,248.72	
TAX		52,950.91	69,040.52	LENOVO 71,662.12 HP 86,510.90	75,386.23	LENOVO 68,405.59 HP 75,868.20	
TOTAL COST		936,237.54	990,875.62	LENOVO 1,005,395.07 HP 1,203,562.13	951,970.30	LENOVO 1,010,979.83 HP 1,114,116.92	



Plan for Purchase

- Vendor: CDW-G
- Chromebook: Lenovo “Yoga” 300e
- Quantities:
 - 2016 Chromebooks
 - 56 Anywhere Carts
- Total Price: \$714,003